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Do you want to do better at university?

Whether you're a student wanting to improve their study skills or a lecturer who wants to give their students
a helping hand with their work, this book is for you.

Essential Study Skills is a proven guide for every student wanting to achieve success at university.

Packed with study tips and handy activities, this study skills handbook shows you step-by-step how to study
effectively and make the best of your time - whatever level you're at.

Whether you are going to university straight from school, a mature student, or an overseas student studying
in the UK for the first time, you'll find out how to:

" Sail through those tricky first weeks

" Get the most out of lectures by understanding how you learn

" Learn techniques for academic writing and research

" Pass exams with flying colours

" Stay cool and cope with stress.

Practical and interactive, this edition features three brand new chapters to arm you with even more essential
skills including how to produce a dissertation, planning your career and focussing on building relationships
with lecturers and other students to help you get ahead.

Also launching with this new edition is an improved and expanded companion website. Don't miss the
extensive range of guidance and resources for both students and tutors, including downloadable templates,
practice exercises and other tools for students to use in both their preparation and their actual work.
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From reader reviews:

William Jewell:

Do you have favorite book? For those who have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing
for us to find out everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or goal; it means that book has
different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They are reading whatever
they acquire because their hobby is reading a book. Why not the person who don't like reading through a
book? Sometime, individual feel need book after they found difficult problem or even exercise. Well,
probably you will need this Essential Study Skills: The Complete Guide to Success at University (SAGE
Study Skills Series).

Brian Wallace:

As people who live in often the modest era should be change about what going on or details even knowledge
to make these people keep up with the era and that is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe
may update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to you is
you don't know what kind you should start with. This Essential Study Skills: The Complete Guide to Success
at University (SAGE Study Skills Series) is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why,
as this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Erin Cummins:

Now a day those who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not need people to be aware of each facts they get. How a lot more to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Reading a book
can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information specially this Essential Study Skills: The
Complete Guide to Success at University (SAGE Study Skills Series) book because this book offers you rich
information and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it
you may already know.

Peter Chatman:

Many people spending their time by playing outside using friends, fun activity together with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by reading through a book.
Ugh, think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It alright you
can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Essential Study Skills: The
Complete Guide to Success at University (SAGE Study Skills Series) which is keeping the e-book version.
So , try out this book? Let's notice.
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