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Gilbert Strang's textbooks have changed the entire approach to learning linear algebra -- away from abstract
vector spaces to specific examples of the four fundamental subspaces: the column space and nullspace of A
and A'.

Introduction to Linear Algebra, Fourth Edition includes challenge problems to complement the review
problems that have been highly praised in previous editions. The basic course is followed by seven
applications: differential equations, engineering, graph theory, statistics, fourier methods and the FFT, linear
programming, and computer graphics.

Thousands of teachers in colleges and universities and now high schools are using this book, which truly
explains this crucial subject.

Chapter 1: Introduction to Vectors; Chapter 2: Solving Linear Equations; Chapter 3: Vector Spaces and
Subspaces; Chapter 4: Orthogonality; Chapter 5: Determinants; Chapter 6: Eigenvalues and Eigenvectors;
Chapter 7: Linear Transformations; Chapter 8: Applications; Chapter 9: Numerical Linear Algebra; Chapter
10: Complex Vectors and Matrices; Solutions to Selected Exercises; Final Exam. Matrix Factorizations.
Conceptual Questions for Review. Glossary: A Dictionary for Linear Algebra Index Teaching Codes Linear
Algebra in a Nutshell.
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From reader reviews:

David Lalonde:

What do you with regards to book? It is not important along? Or just adding material if you want something
to explain what the one you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man? If you don't
have spare time to perform others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have time? What did
you do? All people has many questions above. They should answer that question mainly because just their
can do that will. It said that about publication. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is correct. Because
start from on pre-school until university need this Introduction to Linear Algebra, Fourth Edition to read.

Antoine Dejean:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be revise about what going on or data even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era which can be always change and advance. Some of you
maybe will certainly update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the
problems coming to you actually is you don't know what one you should start with. This Introduction to
Linear Algebra, Fourth Edition is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, because
book serves what you want and need in this era.

Michael Herndon:

The feeling that you get from Introduction to Linear Algebra, Fourth Edition could be the more deep you
rooting the information that hide inside words the more you get enthusiastic about reading it. It does not
mean that this book is hard to be aware of but Introduction to Linear Algebra, Fourth Edition giving you joy
feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in specific way that can be understood by means of
anyone who read the idea because the author of this guide is well-known enough. This specific book also
makes your own personal vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand then can go to you,
both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having this Introduction to Linear
Algebra, Fourth Edition instantly.

Anthony Wilson:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Aim to
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't determine book by its protect may doesn't
work is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not since fantastic as in the outside
appear likes. Maybe you answer could be Introduction to Linear Algebra, Fourth Edition why because the
great cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content
is actually fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly make suggestions to
pick up this book.
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