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With the release of the DSC-RX100 II camera, Sony has built upon the success of the earlier RX100 model,
adding a hot shoe, tilting LCD screen, Wi-Fi capability, upgraded digital sensor, and several other
enhancements. White Knight Press, which published a well-received guide to the RX100, has released this
new guide book that addresses all of the new features of the RX100 II and includes a full discussion of the
many advanced features that are common to both camera models.

With the publication of this book, author Alexander White provides users of the RX100 II with a guide to all
operations, features, menus, and controls of the camera. Using a patient, tutorial-like approach, the book
shows beginning and intermediate photographers not only how to accomplish things with the RX100 II, but
when and why to use the camera's many features.

The book does not assume specialized knowledge by the reader as it explains topics such as autofocus,
manual focus, depth of field, aperture priority, shutter priority, exposure compensation, white balance, and
ISO sensitivity. The book provides full details of the camera's numerous shooting modes as well as its many
menu options for shooting, playback, setup, and special effects. The book includes full coverage of the new
features of the RX100 II, including the use of the camera's built-in capability to transfer images and videos
over a wireless network and to allow the camera to be controlled remotely by a smartphone or tablet.

The book includes approximately 400 photographs, most in full color, which illustrate the camera's controls,
shooting screens, and menus. The images also provide examples of the types of photographs that can be
taken using the many creative settings of the camera, including the Photo Creativity settings, which let the
photographer alter the color processing of images; the Scene shooting mode, with settings that are optimized
for various subjects, including landscapes, portraits, and action shots; the Creative Style and Picture Effect
menu options, which offer dramatic options for altering the appearance of images; and the camera's strong
array of features for continuous shooting and shooting in dim lighting.

In addition, the book goes beyond the bounds of everyday photography, and provides introductions to more
advanced topics such as infrared photography, street photography, astrophotography, digiscoping, and macro
photography. The book also includes a full discussion of the video recording abilities of the RX100 II, which
can shoot high-definition (HD) video with stereo sound, and which offers manual control of exposure and
focus during movie recording.

In three appendices, the book provides information about accessories available for the RX100 II, including
cases, external flash units, viewfinders, and filter adapters, and includes a list of web sites and other
resources for further information. Also, the book includes a detailed appendix with helpful "quick tips" that
give particular insights into how to take advantage of the camera's features in the most efficient ways
possible. This guide to the RX100 II includes a detailed index, so the reader can quickly find needed
information about any particular feature or aspect of the camera.
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From reader reviews:

Katrina Varga:

The book Photographer's Guide to the Sony DSC-RX100 II make you feel enjoy for your spare time. You
can utilize to make your capable far more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting
tension or having big problem with the subject. If you can make examining a book Photographer's Guide to
the Sony DSC-RX100 II to be your habit, you can get considerably more advantages, like add your personal
capable, increase your knowledge about a number of or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if you
like start and read a e-book Photographer's Guide to the Sony DSC-RX100 II. Kinds of book are several. It
means that, science reserve or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this guide?

Teresa Hennessey:

Here thing why this kind of Photographer's Guide to the Sony DSC-RX100 II are different and reliable to be
yours. First of all reading a book is good nonetheless it depends in the content of the usb ports which is the
content is as tasty as food or not. Photographer's Guide to the Sony DSC-RX100 II giving you information
deeper and in different ways, you can find any reserve out there but there is no reserve that similar with
Photographer's Guide to the Sony DSC-RX100 II. It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your
current eyes about the thing this happened in the world which is probably can be happened around you. You
can actually bring everywhere like in recreation area, café, or even in your technique home by train. For
anyone who is having difficulties in bringing the paper book maybe the form of Photographer's Guide to the
Sony DSC-RX100 II in e-book can be your option.

Elmer Dooley:

The book with title Photographer's Guide to the Sony DSC-RX100 II has a lot of information that you can
find out it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this book. This specific book exist new knowledge the
information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to
yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you with new era of the
glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Hubert Macarthur:

The actual book Photographer's Guide to the Sony DSC-RX100 II has a lot of information on it. So when
you check out this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was published by the very famous author.
Mcdougal makes some research previous to write this book. This particular book very easy to read you may
get the point easily after perusing this book.
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